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KEY MEASURES:

A Canberra Liberals 
Government will deliver a new 
stadium in the city at Acton 
Waterfront. 

A new city stadium, delivered 
by the Canberra Liberals will 
provide our local elite sporting 
teams such as the Raiders, 
Brumbies and Canberra United 
with a modern facility fit for the 
big games and fans.

	 Supports the Raiders, 
Brumbies, Canberra United 
and international sporting 
fixtures

	 More world-class events, 
conferences, and concerts in 
Canberra

	 Improve economic benefits 
for the ACT and local 
businesses

	 Better branding for Canberra 
in Australia and internationally 
as a global city

A new city stadium will 
also help Canberra attract 
international sporting events, 
state of origin and world 
class music, cultural and 
entertainment acts. 

	 Revitalise the city centre

	 Attract new tourism 
infrastruture and investment

	 Builds on Civic’s 
entertainment precinct

	 Creates thousands of local 
jobs

	 Connected to key transport 
infrastructure and routes

Build a Stadium in the City
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Build a Stadium in the City

A world class stadium located 
at Acton Waterfront will provide 
enormous social, cultural and 
economic benefits to the ACT 
and help drive foot traffic to 
surrounding restaurants, bars 
and hotels. 

The Canberra Liberals will 
begin construction in the 
first term of government of a 
proposed 30,000 seat stadium 
with a roof to ensure that it can 
accommodate events year-
round. 

City stadiums have 
demonstrated across Australia 
that they provide a significant 
boost to tourism, create 
local jobs, generate private 
investment, and enhance the 
vibrancy of a CBD. 

It is clear the Labor-Greens 
government has no interest 
in building a new stadium 
and Andrew Barr has strung 
Canberrans along for over a 
decade with broken promises 
and multiple feasibility studies.

It is now abundantly clear that 
the Canberra Liberals are the 
only party that will build a new 
stadium for our city.

A modern stadium can 
incorporate sustainable 
design and operations, 
reducing its carbon footprint 
and showcasing Canberra’s 
commitment to environmental 
stewardship.

The Canberra Liberals have 
always been committed to 
building infrastructure projects 
that have the most economic, 
cultural, and social benefit for 
Canberrans. 

A new stadium at Acton 
Waterfront will integrate with 
Stage 2A of Light Rail, the bus 
network, active travel including 
pedestrian networks through 
the city enhancing the overall 
efficiency and accessibility of 
the city. 

A new stadium located in the 
city will signal to the rest of 
Australia and the world that 
Canberra is open for business, 
and open to host world-class 
events.


